City of Fort Worth, Texas

Mayor and Council Communication

DATE: 09/13/22 M&C FILE NUMBER: M&C 22-0666
LOG NAME: 13P22-0152 VETERINARY SUPPLIES AND PHARMACEUTICALS
SUBJECT

(ALL) Authorize Execution of Non-Exclusive Agreements with Founder Project Rx, Inc., Intervet, Inc. dba Merck Animal Health, MWI Veterinary
Supply Co., and Midwest Veterinary Supply, Inc. for Veterinary Supplies and Pharmaceuticals in a Total Combined Annual Amount Up to
$1,000,000.00 for the Code Compliance Department and Authorize Five One-Year Renewal Options for the Same Annual Amount

RECOMMENDATION:

It is recommended that the City Council authorize non-exclusive agreements with Founder Project Rx, Inc., Intervet, Inc. dba Merck Animal Health,
MWI Veterinary Supply Co., and Midwest Veterinary Supply, Inc. for veterinary supplies and pharmaceuticals in a total combined annual amount up
to $1,000,000.00 for the Code Compliance Department and authorize five one-year renewal options for the same annual amount.

DISCUSSION:

The Code Compliance Department approached the Purchasing Division to purchase veterinary supplies and pharmaceuticals. This agreement
will provide necessary veterinary supplies and pharmaceuticals for the Animal Shelters to treat animals that are rescued and treated before they
can be placed for adoption. Purchasing staff issued an Invitation to Bid (ITB) to procure these goods.

ITB 22-0152 was advertised in the Fort Worth Star-Telegram on June 1, 2022, June 8, 2022, June 15, 2022 and June 22, 2022. The bid opened
on June 23, 2022. The Purchasing Division received five (5) responses. Alpha Pro Med was deemed non-responsive because they did not have
the required five (5) years of experience. Staff evaluated the remaining responses based on the lowest responsible bidder and determined that it
is in the City's best interest to award non-exclusive purchase agreements to four (4) bidders. Purchasing Staff certifies that Founder Project Rx Inc,
Intervet Inc. dba Merck Animal Health, MWI Veterinary Supply Co. and Midwest Veterinary Supply Inc. meet the requirements stated in the
specifications. Purchasing Staff recommends awarding purchasing agreements for a combined total up to $1,000,000.00 to meet the
Department's needs. Products will be ordered based on price and availability. No guarantee was made that a specific amount of products would
be purchased.
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3/8 CIRCLE REVERSE CUTTING J70 No bid [No bid [$8.71 g"r?::fa"t“rer
ACEPROMAZINE INJECTABLE No bid [No bid [$23.14  [$20.72
AMBER VIAL WITH CAP 20 DRAM No bid [No bid [$71.68 [$81.07
AMOXI TABLETS 100 MG 500 CT No bid [No bid [$132.20 '\P"ﬁg‘gfacmrer
AMOXI TABLETS 50 MG 500 CT No bid [No bid [$92.30 ';,"ﬁ:gfa"t“rer
AMOXICILLIN - 250MG/500 CT. No bid [$19.90 [$13.08 [$18.79
AMOXICILLIN - 500MG/500 CT. No bid [$29.99 [$20.50 [$33.49
AMPICILLIN INJECTION 25 GM 250 No bid [No bid [$38.00 '\P":g'gfacmrer
BRAVECTO CHEWS 1000MG BLUE 44 |$37.49[No bid [$374.90 [$37.49
BREATHING TUBE ASSEMBLY 36"#S  |No bid [No bid [$15.29 [$126.64
BREATHING TUBE CLEAR 31"PEDIA  |No bid [No bid [$23.53 [$33.41
CEPHALEXIN CAP 250MG GNR 500 K |No bid [$32.04 [$20.00 [$39.72
CEPHALEXIN CAPS 500MG 500 GNR  |No bid [$48.43 [$31.13 [$50.38
CHEWABLE BRAVECTO 250MG .
ORANGE $36.07|No bid [$360.70 [$36.07
CHEWABLE BRAVECTO 500MG GREEN [$36.96|No bid [$369.60 [$36.96
CIPROFLOXACIN TABS 250mg 100's No bid [$7.50 [$5.85  [$8.00




CIPROFLOXACIN TABS 500mg 100's No bid [$14.52 [$11.18  [$9.49
CIPROFLOXACIN TABS 500mg 500's No bid [$69.87 [$73.80 |No bid
CIPROFLOXACIN TABS 750mg 50's No bid [$12.75 [$7.62  |$11.59
CLARITY ULTRASOUND GEL 16 OZ No bid [No bid [$3.89  [$3.75

. . Manufacturer
CLAVAMOX DROPS 12X15ML PFZ 12/ [\o bid [Nobid $170.40 |5/

. . Manufacturer,
CLAVAMOX TABLETS 125 MG 210'S No bid |No bid 1$139.54 o .0

. . Manufacturer
CLAVAMOX TABLETS 250 MG 210'S No bid [No bid $229.81 o

. . Manufacturer,
CLAVAMOX TABLETS 375 MG 210'S No bid |No bid 1§328.37 |5 o

. . Manufacturer
CLAVAMOX TABLETS 625 MG 210's [\o bid [Nobid [§75.30 |5/
CLOR-HEX SCRUB 2% - GAL No bid [No bid |$15.76 |$20.13
COMPLY STEAM/CHEM STRIP 240ct No bid [No bid [[$30.10  [$14.01
COUGH TABLETS DOG & CAT 250ct No bid [No bid [$44.81 [$41.31

. . Manufacturer,
DEXMEDESED INJECTION 0.5 MG/ML | N0 Pid [Nobid $119.14 | 1/
DEXTROSE SOLUTION 50% PVL 500M |No bid [No bid [$3.14  [$2.93
DIPHENHYDRAMINE CAPSULES 25mg  |No bid [$13.04 [$2.27  [$1.92
DIPHENHYDRAMINE CAPSULES 50MG |No bid [$1.88 [$2.53  [$13.53
DIPHENHYDRAMINE INJECTION 50MG  |No bid [$1.02 [$10.47  [$29.80

. . Manufacturer
DIROBAN 50 MG (25mg/2mL) W/ DI No bid |No bid [$246.75 |
Doxycycline 100mg No bid |$4.64 [$30.76 [$32.52
DYNAREX ELASTIC TAPE 2" X 5 YD No bid [$25.20 [$10.98 [$15.56
DYNAREX LAP SPONGE 18"X 18" ST |No bid [No bid [$2.20  [$3.22
ENCORE SENSI-TOUCH LATEX GLOVE |No bid [$7.10 [$34.12 [$45.49

. . Manufacturer
ENROFLOX 100 INJ 100ml No bid |No bid 1$45.08 |5 .0

. . Manufacturer
ENROFLOX INJECTION 2.27% 50ML No bid [No bid $65.90 o

. . Manufacturer,
ENROFLOXACIN FLAVOR TABLETS 22 |0 Pid [Nobid $50.39 |5/
EPINEPHRINE No bid [$11.59 [$26.53 [$23.65
ESBILAC LIQUID 110Z No bid [No bid [$2.91  [$2.85
ESBILAC NURSING bottles 2 0Z K No bid [No bid [$2.39  [$2.36
ESBILAC PWD 120Z (PUPPY) No bid |[No bid [$11.47 |$11.27
ESBILAC PWD 280Z (PUPPY) No bid [No bid |$24.09 [$23.68
FEL NOBIVAC 1 HCPCH ISP 25X1DS  |$66.00[No bid [$80.75 [$66.00

. . Manufacturer
FORTIFLORA CANINE NUTRITIONAL No bid |No bid 1$113.94 5.0

. . Manufacturer
FORTIFLORA FELINE NUTRITIONAL No bid [No bid [$113.94 o
FRESH'N CLEAN SCENTED SHAMPOO |No bid [No bid [$33.96 [$33.36
GABAPENTIN CAPS 100mg No bid |$10.68 [$2.06  |$10.51
GABAPENTIN CAPS 300mg No bid [$20.23 [$3.03  [$32.20
GABAPENTIN CAPS 400mg No bid [$25.54 [$3.55 [$7.32
GABAPENTIN TABS 600mg No bid [$36.24 [$5.71  |$10.95

. . Manufacturer
GAUZE ROLL BANDAGE JgggC 4" 12 N0 bidNobid [$7.18 |5
GENTAMICIN OPHTH SOL STERILE5  |No bid[$1.99 [$1.90  [$21.37
GLOVES SURGICAL STERILE SZ 7.5 No bid [No bid [$27.94 |$45.49
HEARTWORM TEST HESKA ANTIGEN  |No bid [No bid [$36.67 |No bid
HEPARIN SODIUM 1000USP 10ML MD  |No bid [$2.42 [$3.71  [$2.92
HEPARIN SODIUM 1000USP 30ML MD  |No bid [$7.50 [$208.82 [$7.63




Manufacturer

IV KITS - EXT SET 30" No bid |No bid 1$0.92 5,

IV SET PRIMARY 78" 15 DROPS/mL No bid [No bid |$1.01  |$2.75

K9 BORD NOBIVAC INTRATRAC 325  |$84.25[No bid [$84.25 [$84.25

K9 NOBIVAC 1 DAPPV ISP 25X1DS $88.00[No bid |$88.00 |$88.00

KMR LIQUID 11 OZ No bid [No bid [$3.38  [$3.30

KMR PWD 1202 No bid [No bid [$12.40  [$12.19

KMR PWD 2802 No bid [No bid [$24.78  [$24.36

KMR PWD 60Z No bid [No bid [$8.50  [$8.35

KWIK STOP STYPTIC POWDER 14 GM  |No bid [No bid [$4.51  |$4.98
LIDOCAINE HCL INJ 2% 100ML No bid [$13.13 [$2.70  [$2.47
LIMEPLUS PET DIP No bid [No bid |$74.04 I\Pﬂﬁggfacwrer
LOXICOM INJ 5mg/ml SOL 10ml (G No bid |No bid [$140.65 I\Pﬂgggfadurer
LOXICOM INJ 5mg/ml SOL 20ml (G No bid [No bid |$15.68

METZENBAUM SCISSOR GRADE 27+ [\© Pid [No bid [$18.25 I\Pﬂgggfacmrer
METZENBAUM SCISSOR GRADE 27+ ['V© Pid |No bid $1.12 I\Pﬂﬁggfacmrer
MIRTAZAPINE TABLETS 15MG 30CT No bid [$2.02 |$8.56  |$2.39
MONO-JECT PLASTIC HUB NEEDLES  |No bid [No bid [$8.50  |$7.29
MONOJECT SOFT PACK NEEDLES LL  |No bid [No bid [$5.83  [$4.11
MUZZLE CAT LG OVER 11lbs No bid [No bid [$5.77  [$5.69
MUZZLE CAT MED 6-11lbs No bid [No bid [$17.16  [$5.35
MUZZLE CAT SET/3 SM/MED/LG No bid [No bid  |$5.63 I\Pﬂr?ilggfacmrer
MUZZLE CAT SM 0-6lbs No bid [No bid |$6.96  |$5.21
MUZZLE NYLON 3XL BLUE No bid [No bid [$7.32  [$5.49
MUZZLE NYLON 4XL BLUE 120-150 No bid [No bid |$7.67 gﬁggfacmrer
MUZZLE NYLON 5XL BLUE No bid [No bid  |$5.58 hpﬂﬁggfaCturer
MUZZLE NYLON LG BLUE No bid [No bid |$5.02  |$5.27
MUZZLE NYLON MED BLUE No bid [No bid |$39.75  |$4.94
MUZZLE NYLON SET/7 No bid [No bid [$5.02  [$45.10
MUZZLE NYLON SM BLUE No bid [No bid [$5.79  [$4.80
MUZZLE NYLON XL BLUE No bid [No bid [$4.85  |$5.49
MUZZLE NYLON XSMALL BLUE No bid [No bid [$6.58  |$4.61
MUZZLE NYLON XXL BLUE No bid [No bid [$4.85  [$6.27
MUZZLE NYLON XXSMALL BLUE No bid [No bid |$18.38 |$4.88
MUZZLE STORAGE RACK & COLOR cO [\© Pid [No bid [$13.45 I\P/Igg:fadurer
NDL AH 16gaX1" 100CT No bid [No bid |$13.45 |$14.98

NDL VP 16gaX1 1/2" 100CT MONOJ No bid [No bid [$18.94 [$14.24

NDL VP 18gaX1 1/2" 100CT No bid [No bid |$8.07  |$11.04
NEEDLES 12x13 (for Darting) No bid [No bid - |No bid I\Pﬂﬁggfacmrer
NEEDLES 18X1 100 HARD PACK COL  |No bid [No bid [$7.87  [$7.98
NEEDLES 20X1 1/2 100 HARD PACK  |No bid [No bid [$7.87  [$7.98
NEEDLES 20X1 NIP 100 HARD PACK  |No bid [No bid [$7.87  |$7.98
NEEDLES 21X1 100 HARD PACK COL  |No bid [No bid [$9.97  [$7.98
NEEDLES 22X1 1/2 100 HARD PACK  |No bid[No bid [$7.44  [$8.45
NEEDLES 22X1 100 HARD PACK COL  |No bid [No bid [$7.87  |$7.98
NEEDLES 22X3/4 100 HARD PACK C  |No bid [No bid [$7.87  |$8.45
NEEDLES 23X1 100 HARD PACK COL  |No bid [No bid [$7.44  |$9.80




NEEDLES 25X1 100 HARD PACK COL  [No bid [No bid [$8.56  [$7.99
NEEDLES 25X5/8 100 HARD PACK C  |No bid [No bid [$7.87  [$7.98
NEOPOLY-BAC OPTH OINTMENT 5ML  |No bid [$12.19 [$4.82  [$5.52
NEOPOLY-BAC OPTH SUSP 5ML No bid [No bid |No bid _ [$20.41
NITRILE GLOVES LATEX POWDER FR  |No bid [$56.25 [$12.85 |$39.98
NUTRI-CAL 4.250Z CAN No bid |No bid 1$8.23 I\Pﬂgggfacmrer
ONDANSETRON INJECTION 2MG/ML 2 |No bid[$2.03  [$8.92  [$12.78
ONDANSETRON TABLETS 4MG 30CT  |No bid[$1.50 [$1.01  [$3.10
ONDANSETRON TABLETS 8MG 30CT  |No bid[$2.90 [$1.21  [$3.76
PANACUR SUSPENSION 1000 ML *Se | V0 Pid|No bid $131.16 'l\bﬂﬁggfacmrer
PARVOVIRUS ANTIGEN KIT 20 CT C No bid |No bid $319.33 I\Pﬂgggfacmrer
PENJECT PENICILLIN G 100ML PVL No bid [No bid |$10.32 |$31.53
PENROSE TUBING STERILE 1/2" X No bid [No bid |$0.61  |$0.67
PENROSE TUBING STERILE 3/4" x No bid [No bid |$0.75  |No bid

PGII SHARPS CONTAINER 18 GAL No bid [No bid |$26.40 [$30.42
POLY DOX 3/0 PFS-1 REV CUT 30" No bid [No bid [$68.00 |$51.68
POLY-DOX 2/0 PCP-1 30" 1/2 CIR No bid [No bid [$68.00 |$45.88
POLY-DOX PS 0 PCP1 30" VIOLET No bid [No bid |$68.00 |$44.00
POLY-DOX PS 4/0 PFS2 30" PS039 No bid [No bid [$65.24 [$46.32
POLY-DOX SUTURE CASSETTE 025M  |No bid [No bid [$99.82 [$82.65
POLY-DOX SUTURE CASSETTE 2/02  |No bid [No bid [$91.00  [$86.02
POLY-DOX SUTURE CASSETTE 3/02  |No bid [No bid [$76.41 |$60.66
POLY-DOX SUTURE CASSETTE4/02  |No bid [No bid [$68.65 |$55.44
POLYPROPYLENE CATHETER ASSORTE|No bid [No bid [$10.80 [$10.43
Pooper Scooper No bid |[No bid [$15.76 [$17.28
PREDNISONE TABLETS 10MG 1000CT |No bid [$42.39 [$32.72 [$54.06
RIMADYL INJECTION 20ML No bid [No bid |$73.83 hpﬂﬁggfaCturer
SALINE STERILE INJECTABLE 1000 No bid [No bid [$4.08  [$3.94
SCALPEL HOLDERS #3 No bid [No bid [$2.35  |$13.39
SCALPEL STER DISP MX SZ10 No bid [No bid |$15.29 |$10.98
SCALPEL STER DISP MX SZ11 No bid |No bid $15.29 I\Pﬂgggfacmrer
SCALPEL STER DISP MX SZ12 No bid [No bid [$15.29 [$12.09
SCISSORS-LITTAUER STITCH 4.5" No bid [No bid |$7.70  |$9.47
SCISSORS-LITTAUER STITCH 5.5" No bid [No bid |$3.53  |$30.43
SCISSORS-SHARP/BLUNT V@516 op  |\© bid |No bid 136.72 gﬁggfacmrer
SHARPS CONTAINER 1.4-QT RED No bid [No bid |$3.60  |$20.49
SHARPS CONTAINER 14-QT RED No bid [No bid |$6.96  |$8.90
SHARPS CONTAINER 4-QT RED No bid [No bid |$3.02  |$3.25
SHARPS CONTAINER 8-QT RED No bid [No bid |$4.88  |$5.63

SKIN STAPLER PRECISE REMOVER  |No bid[No bid [$3.87  [$4.10
SKUNK-OFF SHAMPOO gallon No bid [No bid |$42.59 |$4.13

SODA LIME J553-B 42 LB 5 GALLO No bid [No bid |$87.00 gﬁggfacmrer
SODA LIME 3Ib BAG J0553 No bid [No bid |$6.12  |$7.76
SOVEREIGN FEEDING TUBE 10 FRx  |No bid[No bid [$1.19  [$21.59
STERILE WATER FOR INJECTION 25  |No bid[No bid [$2.64  [$2.59
SUROLAN OTIC SUSPENSION 15 ML |'\© bid|No bid }$20.59 I\Pﬂﬁggfacmrer
SUTURE CASSETTE HOLDER No bid [No bid |$20.71 [$19.82




SYR 10ML NO NEEDLE LUER LOCK No bid [No bid [$8.00  [$11.43
SYR 1CC 25X5/8 TB LS NIP 100 2 No bid [No bid [$8.47  [$9.79
SYR 20ML LL NIP 50 JD20L No bid [No bid |$13.84 [$27.39
SYR 3CC 22X3/4 LL NIP 100 3L22 No bid [No bid [$6.33  [$12.44
SYR 3CC LL NIP 100 JDO3L No bid [No bid |$5.83  |$11.48
SYR 3CC NO NEEDLE LS NIP 100 J No bid [No bid |$7.64  |$11.47
SYR 5ML NO NEEDLE LL NIP 100 J No bid [No bid [$8.12  [$18.43
SYR 5ML NO NEEDLE LS NIP 100 J No bid [No bid [$9.25  [$18.43
SYR 60CC LL NIP 25 JD+50L No bid |No bid [$12.77 |$20.42
SYR TB 1cc NO NDL 100ct LS No bid [No bid [$8.21  [$27.77
Tattoo ink, green No bid [No bid [$4.94 $13.92

. . Manufacturer,
TELAZOL INJ 100MG/ML C3N 5ML No bid INo bid $59.50 5.

. . Manufacturer
TERRAMYCIN OPHTH OINT 1/8 OZ No bid [No bid $15.75 5.

. . Manufacturer,
TRACH TUBE SIZE-3 EA Nobid|Nobid 5146 5. o

. . Manufacturer
TRACH TUBE SIZE-3.5 EA No bid INo bid [$1.46 o

. . Manufacturer
TRACH TUBE SIZE-4 EA NobidNobid 3146 p;c¢

. . Manufacturer
TRACH TUBE SIZE-4.5 EA Nobid|Nobid $1.46 5. 0

. . Manufacturer
TRACH TUBE SIZE-5 EA No bid [No bid $1.46 5.

. . Manufacturer,
TRACH TUBE SIZE-5.5 EA Nobid|No bid $1.46 5. 0

. . Manufacturer
TRACH TUBE SIZE-6 EA Nobid[Nobid 15146 fp.

. . Manufacturer
TRACH TUBE SIZE-6.5 EA No bid|No bid 5146 5. o

. . Manufacturer
TRACH TUBE SIZE-7 EA Nobid[Nobid 15146 fp ¢

. . Manufacturer
TRACH TUBE SIZE-7.5 EA No bid|No bid §1.46 5. o

. . Manufacturer,
TRACH TUBE SIZE-8 EA Nobid|Nobid 3146 pjc¢

. . Manufacturer
TRACH TUBE SIZE-8.5 EA No bid INo bid $1.46 5.

. . Manufacturer,
TRACH TUBE SIZE-9 EA No bid|No bid 1§1.46 5. 0

. . Manufacturer
TRACH TUBE SIZE-9.5 EA No bid [No bid $1.46 5.

. . Manufacturer
TRACHE TUBE SIZE-10 EA No bid|No bid §1.46 5. o
TRACHE TUBE SIZE-10.5 EA No bid [No bid [$8.28  [$8.86
TRACHE TUBE SIZE-11 EA No bid [No bid [$8.28  [$8.86
TRACHE TUBE SIZE-12 EA No bid [No bid [$8.28  [$8.86
TRACHE TUBE SIZE-13 EA No bid |[No bid [$8.28  |$8.86
TRACHE TUBE SIZE-14 EA No bid [No bid [[$32.00 [$33.02
TRAZODONE TABLETS 100MG 500CT  |No bid [No bid [$18.18  [$7.01
TYLAN SOLUABLE POWDER 100GM  |No bid[$33.80 [$55.36 [$32.24

. . Manufacturer
VECTRA 3D DOG/PUPPY 12x6X1.6ml  [\o Pid Nobid [$831.62 |5

. . Manufacturer,
VECTRA 3D LG DOG 12X6X4.7m pu  [\o bid INo bid [$896.98 |5

. . Manufacturer
VECTRA 3D MED DOG 12X6x3.6mig  [\o bid [Nobid [5875.14 |5




No bid |No bid [$929.95 [Manufacturer

VECTRA 3D XL DOG 12X6X8.0ml RE Prs
VECTRA 3D XSM DOG 12X6X.8mi YE |0 Pid|No bid $775.11 '\P"ﬁ;‘;‘f"""t“rer
VECTRA CATS GREEN 12X6X1.2ml No bid |No bid |§727.67 ggggfacmrer
VECTRA KITTEN BEIGE 12X6X0.8ml No bid |No bid |$727.67 '\P"gg‘:fa‘:turer

CARDBOARD PET TAXI/CARRIER 12 No bid |[No bid |$63.75 $52.75
IV FLUIDS - NaCL(SODIUM CHLORI No bid |$2.50 |$5.41 $55.98
POLY-DOX SUTURE CASSETTE 0 25 No bid [No bid [$106.06 |$82.65
POLY-DOX SUTURE CASSETTE 2/0 No bid [No bid |$96.69 [$86.02
POLY-DOX SUTURE CASSETTE 3/0 No bid |[No bid |$81.19 |$60.66
POLY-DOX SUTURE CASSETTE 4/0 No bid [No bid [$72.94 |$55.44
PREDNISONE TABS 20mg 100ct No bid |$8.32 |$5.73 $8.83

FUNDING: The maximum combined annual amount allowed under this agreement will be $1,000,000.00, however, the actual amount used will be
based on the need of the department and available budget. Funding will be budgeted in the FY 2023 Operating budget in the Drugs Medicines
and Lab account of the Code Compliance Department’'s General Fund.

AGREEMENT TERMS: Upon City Council's approval, this agreement shall begin upon execution and expire on September 30 of that year.

RENEWAL TERMS: The Agreement may be renewed automatically for five one-year renewal options for the same annual amount. The renewals
do not require specific City Council approval as long as sufficient funds have been appropriated.

DVIN-BE: A waiver of the goal for Business Equity subcontracting requirements is approved by the DVIN-BE, in accordance with the Business
Equity Ordinance, because the purchase of goods or services is from sources where subcontracting or supplier opportunities are negligible.

ADMINISTRATIVE CHANGE ORDER: An administrative change order or increase may be made by the City Manager up to the amount allowed by
relevant law and the Fort Worth City Code and does not require specific City Council approval as long as sufficient funds have been appropriated.

FISCAL INFORMATION / CERTIFICATION:

The Director of Finance certifies that upon approval of the above recommendations and adoption of the Fiscal Year 2023 Budget by the City
Council, funds will be available in the Fiscal Year 2023 operating budget, as appropriated, in the General Fund. Prior to an expenditure being
incurred, the Code Compliance Department has the responsibility to validate the availability of funds.

Submitted for City Manager's Office by: David Cooke 8476
Valerie Washington 6192
Originating Business Unit Head: Reginald Zeno 8517

Brandon Bennett 6322
Additional Information Contact: Anthony Rousseau 8338

Heather Oakes 8354




