

Mayor and Council Communication

DATE: 09/13/22

M&C FILE NUMBER: M&C 22-0663

LOG NAME: 13P ITB 22-0191 SIMUNITION AND PROTECTIVE EQUIPMENT MC PD

SUBJECT

(ALL) Authorize Execution of an Agreement with DSG Origin, LTD dba DSG Arms and Colorado Sunrise Holdings, LLC dba TK Tactical for Simunition and Protective Equipment for the Police Department in a Combined Annual Amount Up to \$300,000.00 for the Initial Term and Authorize Five Annual Renewals Options for the Same Amount

RECOMMENDATION:

It is recommended that the City Council authorize execution of an agreement with DSG Origin, LTD dba DSG Arms and Colorado Sunrise Holdings, LLC dba TK Tactical for simunition and protective equipment for the Police Department in a combined annual amount up to \$300,000.00 for the initial term and authorize five annual renewal options for the same amount.

DISCUSSION:

The Police Department approached the Purchasing Division to procure an agreement to supply simunition and protective equipment to provide reality-based training to police recruits and officer survival training to school resource and patrol officers. The intent of the training is to provide real world experiences in a safe training environment and to safely setup scenarios officers encounter while performing their daily duties. Training during these scenarios has a significant impact on the recruits, school resource and patrol officers psychology and physiology to approach real world situations and allows all involved in the training to have a greater ability to analyze and assess all parties interactions and make the appropriate adjustments.

In order to procure these products, Purchasing staff issued Invitation to Bid (ITB) No. 22-0191. The ITB consisted of detailed specifications describing the various applications and requirements for these simunitions and protective equipment and listed product types with full descriptions and the quantities required.

The bid was advertised in the *Fort Worth Star-Telegram* on July 27, 2022, August 3, 2022 and August 10, 2022. The City received two (2) responses. Staff evaluated the responses based on the lowest responsible bidder and determined that it is in the City's best interest to award a purchase agreement to DSG Origin, LTD. dba DSG Arms and Colorado Sunrise Holdings, LLC dba TK Tactical. Under these agreements, the Police Department will order goods according to the table below. No guarantee was made that a specific amount of goods would be purchased. Staff certifies that the recommended vendors met the bid specifications.

BID LINE ITEM	DESCRIPTION	DSG Origin, LTD.	TK Tactical	RECCOMENDED VENDOR
1	SIMUNITION® Gen 3 for Glock 17/22/31/35 Slide Conversions Kit - Part Number: 5312600	\$ 515.00	\$ 515.00	DSG/TK Tactical
2	SIMUNITION® Gen 3 for Glock 19/23 Slide Conversion Kit - Part Number: 5312610	\$ 515.00	\$ 515.00	DSG/TK Tactical
3	SIMUNITION® Gen 4 for Glock 19/23 Slide Conversion Kit - Part Number: 5312025	\$ 546.00	\$ 546.00	DSG/TK Tactical
4	SIMUNITION® Gen 4 for Glock 17/22/31/35 MOS Slide Conversion Kit - Part Number: 5313870	\$ 526.00	\$ 526.00	DSG/TK Tactical
5	SIMUNITION® Gen 5 for Glock 17/22/31/35 Slide Conversion Kit - Part Number: 5313930	\$ 520.00	\$ 526.00	DSG Origin, LTD.
6	SIMUNITION® Gen 5 MOS for Glock 17/22/31/35 Slide Conversion Kit - Part Number: 5314350	\$ 526.00	\$ 526.00	DSG/TK Tactical
7	SIMUNITION® Gen 5 for Glock 19/23 MOS Slide Conversion Kit - Part Number: 5314370	\$ 546.00	\$ 546.00	DSG/TK Tactical
8	SIMUNITION® SIG P226 Standard Slide (9MM) Part Number: 5307500	\$ 215.00	\$ 215.00	DSG/TK Tactical
9	SIMUNITION® SIG P229 Slide Conversion Kit Part Number: 5309160	\$ 306.00	\$ 306.00	DSG/TK Tactical

10	SIMUNITION® SIG P320 Full Size Slide Conversion Kit - Part Number: 5313070	\$ 670.00	\$ 670.00	DSG/TK Tactical
11	SIMUNITION® SIG P320 Compact/Carry Size Slide Conversion Kit (requires 9MM magazine) Part Number: 5313330	\$ 670.00	\$ 670.00	DSG/TK Tactical
12	SIMUNITION® 5.56MM Bolt Conversion Kit without Sporter Block - Part Number: 5308990	\$ 299.00	\$ 298.00	TK Tactical
13	SIMUNITION® Spare .38 SPL (set of 7) Part Number: 5500490SP	\$ 6.00	\$ 6.00	DSG/TK Tactical
14	SIMUNITION® Spare .357 SPL (set of 7) Part Number: 5500500SP	\$ 6.00	\$ 6.00	DSG/TK Tactical
15	SIMUNITION® 12GA Pump Action 2 3/4, 3" for use with 9mm FX® - Part Number: 5312430	\$ 292.00	\$ 291.00	TK Tactical
16	SIMUNITION® 9mm Conversion for 40mm Non-Lethal Grenade Launcher includes 3 Rounds Part Number: 5312400	\$ 460.00	\$ 460.00	DSG/TK Tactical
17	SIMUNITION® FX® 9003 Head Protector Black Part Number: 8971998	\$ 196.00	\$ 196.00	DSG/TK Tactical
18	SIMUNITION® FX® 9002 Helmet with Nasal Seal - Black Part Number: 8971790	\$ 200.00	\$ 200.00	DSG/TK Tactical
19	SIMUNITION® FX® 9000 Protective Neck Collar - One Size Fits All - Part Number: 8971764	\$ 47.00	\$ 47.00	DSG/TK Tactical
20	SIMUNITION® FX® 9000 Groin Protector - Female Part Number: 8971771	\$ 49.00	\$ 49.00	DSG/TK Tactical
21	SIMUNITION® FX® 9000 Groin Protector - Male Part Number: 8971770	\$ 59.00	\$ 59.00	DSG/TK Tactical
22	SIMUNITION® FX® 9000 Arm Protectors - One Pair Part Number: 8971517	\$ 67.00	\$ 66.00	TK Tactical
23	SIMUNITION® FX® 9000 Protective Vest (Women) Part Number: 8971835	\$ 102.00	\$ 102.00	DSG/TK Tactical
24	SIMUNITION® FX® 9000 Protective Vest (Men) Part Number: 8971830	\$ 102.00	\$ 102.00	DSG/TK Tactical
25	SIMUNITION® FX® 9000 Protective Gloves Size: Small (S) Part Number: 8971875	\$ 52.00	\$ 52.00	DSG/TK Tactical
26	SIMUNITION® FX® 9000 Protective Gloves Size: Extra Large (XL) Part Number: 8971878	\$ 52.00	\$ 52.00	DSG/TK Tactical
27	SIMUNITION® FX® 9000 Protective Gloves Size: Extra Extra Large (XXL) Part Number: 8971884	\$ 52.00	\$ 52.00	DSG/TK Tactical
28	SIMUNITION® FX® 9000 Protective Gloves Size: Medium (M) Part Number: 8971876	\$ 52.00	\$ 52.00	DSG/TK Tactical
29	SIMUNITION® FX® 9000 Protective Gloves Size: Large (L) Part Number: 8971877	\$ 52.00	\$ 52.00	DSG/TK Tactical
30	SIMUNITION® FX® 9000 Protective Sleeves - One Pair Size: Small/Medium (S/M) Part Number: 8971281	\$ 92.00	\$ 92.00	DSG/TK Tactical
31	SIMUNITION® FX® 9000 Protective Sleeves - One Pair Size: Large/Extra Large (L/XL) Part Number: 8971286	\$ 92.00	\$ 92.00	DSG/TK Tactical
32	SIMUNITION® FX® 9000 Protective Pants Size: Medium (M) Part Number: 8971216	\$ 159.00	NO BID	DSG Origin, LTD.
33	SIMUNITION® FX® 9000 Protective Pants Size: Extra Large (XL) Part Number: 8971218	\$ 159.00	NO BID	DSG Origin, LTD.
34	SIMUNITION® FX® 9000 Protective Pants Size: Large (L) Part Number: 8971217	\$ 159.00	NO BID	DSG Origin, LTD.
35	SIMUNITION® FX® Marking Cartridges 9mm - Red 500 Rounds Case / 50 Rounds Boxes Part Number: 5320761	\$ 306.36	\$ 274.00	TK Tactical
	SIMUNITION® FX® Marking Cartridges			

36	9mm - Yellow 500 Rounds Case / 50 Round Boxes Part Number: 5320764	\$ 306.36	\$ 274.00	TK Tactical
37	SIMUNITION® FX® Marking Cartridges 9mm - Green 500 Rounds Case / 50 Round Boxes Part Number: 5320765	\$ 306.36	\$ 274.00	TK Tactical
38	SIMUNITION® FX® Marking Cartridges 9mm - Blue 500 Rounds Case / 50 Round Boxes Part Number: 5320762	\$ 306.36	\$ 274.00	TK Tactical
39	SIMUNITION® SecuriBlank® Loud Cartridges 9MM Toxfree 500 Rounds Case / 50 Round Boxes Part Number: 5306003	\$ 235.32	\$ 212.00	TK Tactical
40	SIMUNITION® FX® Gen 2 Marking Cartridges 5.56mm Red Clipped Toxfree - 500 Rounds Case / 20 Round Boxes Part Number: 5360141	\$ 391.83	\$ 353.00	TK Tactical
41	SIMUNITION® SecuriBlank® Loud Cartridges 5.56mm ToxFree - 500 Rounds Case / 20 Round Boxes Part Number: 5359108	\$ 389.61	\$ 351.00	TK Tactical
42	SIMUNITION® SecuriBlank® Quiet Cartridges 9mm ToxFree 500 Rounds Case Part Number: 5306006	\$ 235.32	\$ 212.00	TK Tactical
43	SIMUNITION® SecuriBlank® Quiet Cartridges 5.56mm ToxFree 25.00 500 Rounds Case Part Number: 5359107	\$ 389.61	\$ 351.00	TK Tactical
44	Expedited Delivery	NO BID	\$ 479.34	TK Tactical

FUNDING: The maximum amount allowed under this agreement will be \$300,000.00, however the actual amount used will be based on the need of the department and available budget. The annual department allocation for this agreement is:

Department	Estimated Annual Amount	Account Name
Police	\$300,000.00	5610109 - Minor Equipment

Funding is budgeted in the Police Department's rollup within the General Fund.

DVIN-BE: A waiver of the goal for Business Equity subcontracting requirement is approved by the DVIN-BE, in accordance with the Business Equity Ordinance, because the purchase of goods or services is from sources where subcontracting or supplier opportunities are negligible.

ADMINISTRATIVE CHANGE ORDER: An administrative change order or increase may be made by the City Manager up to the amount allowed by relevant law and the Fort Worth City Code and does not require specific City Council approval as long as sufficient funds have been appropriated.

AGREEMENT TERMS: Upon City Council approval, this agreement shall begin upon execution and expire on September 30, 2022.

RENEWAL OPTIONS: This agreement may be automatically renewed for five (5) one-year renewal periods (October 1st to September 30th). This action does not require specific City Council approval provided that the City Council has appropriated sufficient funds to satisfy the City's obligations during the renewal term.

FISCAL INFORMATION / CERTIFICATION:

The Director of Finance certifies that upon approval of the recommendation, funds are available in the current operating budget, as previously appropriated, in the General Fund. Prior to an expenditure being incurred, the Police Department has the responsibility to validate the availability of funds.

Submitted for City Manager's Office by: Reginald Zeno 8517
Fernando Costa 6122

Originating Business Unit Head: Anthony Rousseau 8338
Neil Noakes 4212

Additional Information Contact: Cynthia Garcia 8525
Maria Canoura 2526