City of Fort Worth, Texas
Mayor and Council Communication

DATE: 11/08/22 M&C FILE NUMBER: M&C 22-0911

LOG NAME: 13P ITB 22-0211 SPECIALIZED LAW ENFORCEMENT EQUIPMENT AW PD
SUBJECT

(ALL) Authorize Execution of Purchase Agreements with Z Bar Supply Company LLC, GT Distributors, Inc., and M Pak, Inc. for the Replacement
of Specialized Law Enforcement Equipment for the Police Department in a Combined Annual Amount Up to $1,500,000.00 for the Initial Term and
Authorize Four, One-Year Renewals for the Same Annual Amount

RECOMMENDATION:

It is recommended that the City Council authorize execution of purchase agreements with Z Bar Supply Company LLC, GT Distributors, Inc., and M
Pak, Inc. for the replacement of specialized law enforcement equipment for the Police Department in a combined annual amount up to
$1,500,000.00 for the initial term and authorize four, one-year renewals for the same annual amount.

DISCUSSION:

The Police Department approached the Purchasing Division for assistance with securing an agreement for the replacement of specialized law
enforcement equipment on an as-needed basis. Under the proposed agreement, the vendors will provide law enforcement equipment that will
assist officer awareness when conducting their duties. Purchasing issued an Invitation to Bid (ITB) that consisted of detailed specifications
regarding the requirements for the equipment, delivery and warranties.

The ITB was advertised in the Fort Worth Star-Telegram on August 31, 2022, September 7, 2022, and September 14, 2022. The City received
three responses.

Staff evaluated the bid responses based on lowest, responsible bidder criteria and recommends awarding an initial agreement to Z Bar Supply
Company LLC, GT Distributors, Inc., and M Pak, Inc. with four, additional one-year renewals per the line items listed below. No guarantee was
made that a specific amount of items will be purchased.

L Z Bar Supply | GT Distributors,
Description Company LLC Inc. M Pak, Inc.
Eotech ClipIR-|  $58,000.00
XELR Clip On NO BID NO BID
12micron  |(Recommended)
Thermal
L3 Harris $238,500.00
BNVD-Fused NO BID NO BID
Kit, 2500 MIN |(Recommended)
FOM, WP, AV
L3 Harris $10,300.00
PVS-31A Kit, NO BID NO BID
2376 MIN  |[(Recommended)
FOM, WP
L3 Harris $9,200.00
BNVD 1531 NO BID NO BID
Kit, 2376 MIN |(Recommended)
FOM, WP
L3 Harris $1,450.00
ATPIAL NO BID NO BID
PEQ15- |(Recommended)
Black
_ $1,450.00
L3 Harris NO BID NO BID
ATPIAL  |(Recommended)
PEQ15 - Tan




$87,100.00

L3 Harris NO BID NO BID
NGAL Kit, HP, |(Recommended)
1 Meter, Tan
L3 Harris
M2124-LR $7,750.00
Night Vision NO BID NO BID
Clip On, 2376 |(Recommended)
MIN FOM, WP
L3 Harris
PVS- $38,500.00
14/M914A, NO BID NO BID
2376 MIN [(Recommended)
FOM, WP
Eotech Mini $9,800.00
Dual Tube NV NO BID NO BID
Bino Kit, 2000|(Recommended)
FOM Photonis
$2,000.00
Eotech IRVIS NO BID NO BID
Laser Device |(Recommended)
-Tan
Eotech Dual $9,700.00
Tube NV Bino NO BID NO BID
Kit, 2376  |(Recommended)
FOM Elbit
Optics 1E- | $218,400.00
COTI Thermal NO BID NO BID
Device with |(Recommended)
PVS31 Mount
$315.00
Optics 1 E- NO BID NO BID
COTI PVS31 |(Recommended)
Mount
Optics 1 E-
COTI Battery $1,650.00
Pack and Y NO BID NO BID
Cable for [(Recommended)
PVS31
Eotech ClipIR
Clip On $9,850.00
17micron NO BID NO BID
Thermal up to [(Recommended)
8X
Eotech ClipIR-
LR Clip On $10,350.00
17micron NO BID NO BID
Thermal up to [(Recommended)
12X
Cadex $440.00
Defense NVG NO BID NO BID
Flip Mount - |(Recommended)
Black or Tan
$10,818.60
Wilcox G24 $11,440.00 NO BID
Flip Mount - (Recommended)
Black or Tan
Pulsar
Accolade $5,000.00
PRO XP50 NO BID $5,225.65
Thermal Bino |[(Recommended)

w/ LRF




$7,170.00

Pulsar Helion NO BID $7,356.52
PRO XP50 |(Recommended)
Monocular
Pulsar Axion 1,330.00
XM30F NO BID $1,404.35
Thermal  |(Recommended)
Monocular
$1,775.00
Pulsar Axion 2 NO BID $1,839.13
XQ35 Thermal|(Recommended)
Monocular
$2,708.56
Pulsar Axion 2 $2,750.00 NO BID
XG35 Thermal (Recommended)
Monocular
Pulsar Axion 2
XAOSLRE | $2,220.00
NO BID NO BID
Monocular (Recommended)
w/Range
Finder
Team Wendy
Ballistic $950.00
Helmet - NO BID $689.10
Black, Green |(Recommended)
orTan
Team Wendy
Ballistic SL $33,150.00
Helmet - NO BID NO BID
Black, Green |(Recommended)
orTan
Team Wendy
Chin Strap $6.00
Extender - NO BID NO BID
Black, Green |(Recommended)
orTan
Team Wendy $240.00
Exfil Face NO BID $120.95
Shield - Black, |(Recommended)
Green or Tan
Team Wendy $260.00
Ballistic Visor NO BID NO BID
- Black, Green |(Recommended)
orTan
Team Wendy
Ballistic $360.00
Mandible - NO BID NO BID
Black, Green |(Recommended)
orTan
Ops Core $835.00
AMP Headset NO BID NO BID
Connectorized |(Recommended)
W/O NFMI
Ops Core $140.00
AMP Arm w/ NO BID NO BID
Team Wendy |(Recommended)
Adapter
Eotech EFLX
Mini Reflex $129,500.00
Sight with 3 $133,870.00 NO BID




MOA dot-  |(Recommended)
Black
Eotech XPS2-
0 HWS Sight $445.00
Absolute $480.00 NO BID
Cowitness  |(Recommended)
Black
Eotech
EXPS3-0
HWS NVG $560.00
Comp 1/3 $622.22 NO BID
Cowitness |(Recommended)
Black or Tan
Eotech G33
3X Magnifier $475.00
w/ Flip to Side $513.33 NO BID
Mount BLK or |(Recommended)
Tan
Eotech G45
5X Magnifier $527.00
w/ Flip to Side $571.11 NO BID
Mount BLK or |(Recommended)
Tan
$1,175.00
Eotech Vudu $1,276.67 NO BID
1-10 FFP  |(Recommended)
Scope
$22,000.00
Eotech Vudu $23,861.00 NO BID
1-6 FFP  |(Recommended)
Scope
Aimpoint PRO $105,645.00
with QRP2 $108,000.00 NO BID
Mount and (Recommended)
39MM Spacer
. . $46,618.00
Aimpoint $47,500.00 NO BID
ACRO P2 (Recommended)
Pistol Sight
. . $699.45
Aimpoint $705.00 NO BID
Comp M5 - (Recommended)
No Mount
o $664.29
Aimpoint $665.00 NO BID
Micro T-2 - No (Recommended)
Mount
. . $621.43
Aimpoint $625.00 NO BID
Micro H-2 - No (Recommended)
Mount
$437.36
$440.00 NO BID
(Recommended)
Aimpoint RDS
$47,722.00
$50,000.00 NO BID
Trijicon SRO (Recommended)
Any MOA

Trijicon RMR




Type 2 $44,526.00
Adjustable - $47,000.00 NO BID
Black, Any (Recommended)

MOA

Streamlight
TLR-7A Flex -
Includes low
switch, high
switch, $30,000.00
CR123A

lithium (Recommended)
batteries

$33,132.00 NO BID

Surefire
Flashlight - $30,000.00
weapon mount NO BID NO BID
or handheld |(Recommended)
LED
Cyalume 4”
Glow Sticks, $130.00
Orange or NO BID NO BID

green, Case |(Recommended)
of 100

Cyalume 4" $230.00
Glow Stick, NO BID NO BID
Infared, Case |(Recommended)
of 100

L3 Harris
GPNVG
System Kit,
2376 min $35,750.00 NO BID NO BID
FOM UF,

Ruggedized |(Recommended)
Bridge - Tan

Funding is budgeted in the Police Department's rollup within the Crime Control & Prev Dist Operating Fund.

DVIN-BE: A waiver of the goal for Business Equity subcontracting requirement is approved by the DVIN-BE, in accordance with the Business
Equity Ordinance, because the purchase of goods or services is from sources where subcontracting or supplier opportunities are negligible.

AGREEMENT TERMS: Upon City Council approval, this agreement shall begin upon execution and expire on September 30, 2023.

RENEWAL TERMS: This agreement may be renewed for four additional, one-year terms. This action does not require specific City Council
approval provided that the City Council has appropriated sufficient funds to satisfy the City's obligations during the renewal term.

ADMINISTRATIVE CHANGE ORDER: An administrative change order or increase may be made by the City Manager up to the amount allowed by
relevant law and the Fort Worth City Code and does not require specific City Council approval as long as sufficient funds have been appropriated.

FISCAL INFORMATION / CERTIFICATION:

The Director of Finance certifies that funds are available in the current operating budget, as previously appropriated, in the Crime Control & Prev
Distr Fund to support the approval of the above recommendation and execution of the purchase agreement. Prior to an expenditure being
incurred, the Police Department has the responsibility to validate the availability of funds.

Submitted for City Manager's Office by: Reginald Zeno 8517
Fernando Costa 6122
Originating Business Unit Head: Reginald Zeno 8517
Neil Noakes 4212
Additional Information Contact: Anthony Rousseau 8338

Alyssa Wilkerson 8357



